
BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE 
Mayor & Borough Council Meeting Agenda 

September 14, 2020 – 7:00 p.m. 

 

 

1.   CALL MEETING TO ORDER  

 

 Mayor Mary Jane Canose 

 Council Member John Donahue 

 Council Member Jeffrey Hammond 

 Council Member Jena McCredie 

 Council Member Chad McQueen 

 Council Member Thomas O’Dea 

 Council Member Christine Zamarra 

 
 
2.   STATEMENT OF PRESIDING OFFICER 

 

Notice of this meeting was provided to the Bernardsville News, Courier News and the 

Star Ledger, filed with the Municipal Clerk and posted on the Municipal Bulletin Board 

on January 3, 2020. 

 

 

3. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
 

 

 

4.   PRESENTATIONS  
  

 4A.  Eagle Project – Borough Springs Trail   

 

4B.  Topology  

 

 

5. OPEN SESSION 

 
At this point in the meeting, the Mayor & Council welcome comments from any member of the public.  To 
help facilitate an orderly meeting and to permit the opportunity for anyone who wishes to be heard, speakers 
shall limit their comments to 3 minutes.  If reading from a prepared statement, please provide a copy and 
email a copy to the Clerk's Office after making your comments so it may be properly reflected in the minutes. 

 

 

6.   ITEMS OF BUSINESS 
 

 

 6A. ORDINANCES (Public Hearing)  
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Mayor to open public hearing on Ordinance #2020-1849, AN ORDINANCE 
APPROPRIATING $11,000 FROM THE BOROUGH OPEN SPACE TRUST 
FUND FOR REIMBURSEMENT TO THE SOMERSET HILLS LITTLE 
LEAGUE FOR RENOVATIONS TO THE KIWANIS LITTLE LEAGUE FIELD 
Mayor to close public hearing 

 

 I move to pass Ordinance #2020-1849 on final reading and adopt as published: 

  

Second: 

 Roll call vote: 

 

 

Mayor to open public hearing on Ordinance #2020-1850, ORDINANCE OF THE 
BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE, N.J. AUTHORIZING THE ACQUISITION 
BY PURCHASE OR CONDEMNATION OF THE REAL PROPERTY LOCATED 
AT 63 BERNARDS AVENUE, BLOCK 102, LOT 12, BERNARDSVILLE, NEW 
JERSEY NOW OWNED BY THE ESTATE OF MICHAEL MENNELLA 
Mayor to close public hearing 

 

 I move to pass Ordinance #2020-1850 on final reading and adopt as published:  

Second: 

 Roll call vote: 

 

 

 Mayor to open public hearing on Ordinance #2020-1851, AN ORDINANCE 
ESTABLISHING AN EXPIRATION DATE FOR CONSTRUCTION RECORDS 
CLEARANCE CERTIFICATES AND SUPPLEMENTING AND AMENDING 
CHAPTER XII OF THE BOROUGH CODE ENTITLED "BUILDING AND 
HOUSING" 
Mayor to close public hearing 

 

 I move to pass Ordinance #2020-1851 on final reading and adopt as published:  

Second: 

 Roll call vote: 

 
 ORDINANCES (Introduction)  

  

I move that Ordinance #2020-1853, APPROPRIATING AN ADDITIONAL $60,000 
FROM THE BOROUGH OPEN SPACE TRUST FUND FOR CONSTRUCTION 
OF THE POLO GROUNDS WALKING PATH, funding from the Borough’s Open 

Space Fund to the Polo Grounds Walking Path project, be introduced by title, passed on 

first reading, published according to law, and that a public hearing be scheduled for a 

meeting beginning at 7:00 p.m., Monday, September 28, 2020. 
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Second: 

 Voice Vote:  
 
 

I move that Ordinance #2020-1854, ORDINANCE OF THE BOROUGH OF 
BERNARDSVILLE, COUNTY OF SOMERSET, NEW JERSEY 
ADOPTING THE REDEVELOPMENT PLAN FOR BLOCK 70, LOTS 1, 2, 
3, 4, 5, 6, 6.01, 6.02, 6.03, 6.04, 6.05, 6.06, 6.07 AND  6.08; BLOCK 71, LOTS 
4, 5, 5.01, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12 AND 13 AND THE QUIMBY LANE RIGHT 
OF WAY AS SHOWN ON THE OFFICIAL TAX MAP OF THE 
BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE PURSUANT TO THE LOCAL 
REDEVELOPMENT AND HOUSING LAW, N.J.S.A. 40A:12A-1 ET SEQ. 
(Quimby Lane), be introduced by title, passed on first reading, published 

according to law, and that a public hearing be scheduled for a meeting beginning 

at 7:00 p.m., Tuesday, October 13, 2020. 

 
Second: 

 Voice Vote:  
 
 

 6B.   RESOLUTIONS 
 
 #20-208A  AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF BILLS (as of August 19th)  
 
 #20-208B  AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF BILLS (after of August 19th)  
 

#20-209 CHANGING THE CUSTODIAN OF THE RECREATION OFFICE 
PETTY CASH FUND 

 
#20-210  AUTHORIZING DEER MANAGEMENT HUNT ON BOROUGH-

OWNED PROPERTIES FOR THE 2020-2021 BOW HUNTING 
SEASON 

 
#20-211  AUTHORIZING REFUND OF RENTAL REGISTRATION FOR 

JOSHUA & PATRICIA STILES FOR 144-1 ROUNDTOP ROAD 
 
#20-212  AUTHORIZING RENEWAL OF A.B.C. LICENSES 
 
#20-213  AUTHORIZATION TO REFUND OVERPAYMENT OF 

MUNICIPAL MATCH 2020/2021 MUNICIPAL ALLIANCE 
GRANT 
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#20-214 MEMORIALIZING THE APPOINTMENT OF TOM ANDERSON 

AS TEMPORARY PART TIME FIRE INSPECTOR 
 
#20-215  EXTENDING TIME TO AWARD WALKING PATH CONTRACT 
 
#20-216  AUTHORIZATION OF TAX REFUND 
 

        #20-217  CORRECTIVE ACTION PLAN FOR 2019 AUDIT REPORT OF 
THE BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE, SOMERSET COUNTY, 
NEW JERSEY 

 
#20-218  AMENDING THE PROFESSIONAL SERVICES CONTRACT 

WITH BEVAN, MOSCA, & GIUDITTA AND EXETER 
ASSOCIATES, INC. 

 
#20-219 AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR AND CLERK TO SIGN A  

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES CONTRACT WITH BURGIS 
ASSOCIATES 

 
#20-220  AUTHORIZATION TO REFUND OVERPAYMENT OF 

MUNICIPAL MATCH 2020/2021 MUNICIPAL ALLIANCE 
GRANT 

 
#20-221 AUTHORIZATION OF SEWER REFUND 

 
I move to adopt Resolutions #20-208A to #20- 

 

Second:  

   Roll call vote: 

 
6C. Draft Ordinance #2020-1852, SUPPLEMENTING AND AMENDING THE 

BOROUGH LAND USE ORDINANCE TO CREATE A NEW DOWNTOWN 

ZONING DISTRICT WITH FOUR DOWNTOWN SUBDISTRICTS WITH 

RELATED ZONING AND DESIGN REGULATIONS  

 

6D. 271 Mine Brook Road Subdivision 

 

6E. Renewal of Membership in the Suburban Municipal Joint Insurance Fund (JIF) 

 

6F.  Daylighting Drainage Ordinance 

 

6G.  Class of 2020 Garden  

 

6H.  Draft Resolution Re: JCP&L 
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6I.  Facebook pages for Borough committees 

 

6J. Speeding and traffic data and mitigation/Lloyd Rd 

 

6K.  Mayor’s Update 

 

6L.  Correspondence  

 

 6L (1) Summer Swim Program 

 

 6L (2) Request for Use of Library Parking Lot on September 19th   

 

6M.  Unfinished Business 

 

6N.  New Business 

 

 

7.    CLOSED SESSION 

 

 

Council Member ____________ moves, to adjourn to an executive session to consider:  

 

Personnel Matters 

 
 (Collective Bargaining, Contract negotiations, Personnel Matters, Pending or Anticipated Litigation, 

Property Acquisition, Attorney/Client Privilege), and that the time when and circumstances under 

which the matter can be disclosed to the public is when it (they) are finally resolved.   

 

 

 Second:  

 Voice Vote: 

 

 

8.  REOPEN AND ADJOURNMENT                                         091420ag 



BERNARDSVILLE BOROUGH 

ORDINANCE #2020-1849 

 

AN ORDINANCE APPROPRIATING $11,000 FROM THE BOROUGH OPEN SPACE 

TRUST FUND FOR REIMBURSEMENT TO THE SOMERSET HILLS LITTLE 

LEAGUE FOR RENOVATIONS TO THE KIWANIS LITTLE LEAGUE FIELD 

 

 

WHEREAS, 20% of Open Space Trust Fund moneys acquired prior to 2020, and 100% of the 

Borough’s Open Space Trust Fund moneys acquired from 2020 forward, may be used for the 

development of lands acquired for recreation and conservation purposes; and 

 

WHEREAS, “development” was defined in the 2008 public question to mean: 

 

“[A]ny improvement to a land….area of eligible Borough property that is designed to 

expand or enhance its utilization for outdoor recreation…purposes and shall include the 

construction, renovation, or repair of any such improvement.  This term may include any 

of the following types of ancillary improvements to eligible Borough properties: roadways, 

parking, landscaping, fencing, lighting, utilities, structures, and any other improvement that 

expands or enhances the use of property for outdoor recreation…purposes”; and; 

 

WHEREAS, Somerset Hills Little League has contracted with Georgia Golf Construction, Inc. of 

Woodbine NJ for the repair and renovations of the Kiwanis Little League Field for a total estimated 

cost of $21,550; and 

 

WHEREAS, the Somerset Hills Little League has requested that the town contribute 50% of the 

cost of the project; and 

 

WHEREAS, the Borough has deemed the project to be necessary and/or valuable developments 

to its open space inventory, 

 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and Council of the Borough of 

Bernardsville in the County of Somerset, State of New Jersey as follows: 

 

 Section 1. Eleven Thousand ($11,000) dollars is hereby appropriated from the 

Borough Open Space Trust fund to fund the developments described above. 

 

 Section 2.  Any or all other ordinances or parts thereof in conflict or inconsistent with 

any of the terms hereof are hereby repealed to such extent as they are so in conflict or inconsistent. 

 

 Section 3. In case any article, section or provision of this ordinance shall be held 

invalid in any court of competent jurisdiction, the same shall not affect any other article, section 



or provision of this ordinance except insofar as the article, section or provision so declared invalid 

shall be inseparable from the remainder of any portion thereof. 

 

 Section 4. This ordinance shall become effective immediately upon final passage and 

publication as required by law. 

 

       COUNCIL OF THE BOROUGH OF 

       BERNARDSVILLE IN THE COUNTY 

ATTEST:      OF SOMERSET 

 

 

_________________________   By:       

Anthony Suriano, Borough Clerk          Mary Jane Canose, Mayor 
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2nd Publication:      



 

 

ORDINANCE #2020-1850 

ORDINANCE OF THE BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE, N.J. 

AUTHORIZING THE ACQUISITION BY PURCHASE OR 

CONDEMNATION OF THE REAL PROPERTY LOCATED AT 63 

BERNARDS AVENUE, BLOCK 102, LOT 12, BERNARDSVILLE, 

NEW JERSEY NOW OWNED BY THE ESTATE OF MICHAEL 

MENNELLA. 

 
WHEREAS, the New Jersey Supreme Court, through its rulings in In re 

Adoption of N.J.A.C. 5:96 and 5:97 by the New Jersey Council on Affordable 
Hous., 221 N.J. 1 (2015) (Mount Laurel IV); Hills Dev. Co. v. Twp.of Bernards 103 
N.J. 1 (1986) (Mount Laurel III); S. Burlington Cty. NAACP v. Twp. of Mount Laurel, 
92 N.J. 158 (1983) (Mount Laurel II); . Burlington Cty. NAACP v. Twp. of Mount 
Laurel, 67 N.J. 151,174 (1975) (Mount Laurel I) (the “Mount Laurel Decisions”), 
has determined that municipalities in New Jersey have a constitutional obligation 
to provide a realistic opportunity for a fair share of its region's present and 
prospective needs for housing for low and moderate income families; and 

 
WHEREAS, the New Jersey State Legislature, in response to the Mount 

Laurel Decisions, adopted the Fair Housing Act, N.J.S.A. 53:27D-301 et seq. to 
codify the obligation of municipalities to provide a realistic opportunity for housing 
for low and moderate income families; and 

 

WHEREAS, the Borough recognizes its obligation under the State 
Constitution, as further set forth in the Mount Laurel Decisions and the Fair 
Housing Act, to provide a realistic opportunity for housing for low and moderate 
income individuals and families; and 

 
WHEREAS, on July 6, 2015, the Borough filed a declaratory judgment 

action, in accordance with Mount Laurel IV, seeking a declaration of its compliance 
with the Mount Laurel Decisions and the Fair Housing Act (the “Action”); and 

 
WHEREAS, The Fair Share Housing Center (FSHC) intervened in the 

Action and, with the assistance of a special master, reached a settlement with the 
Borough (the “Fair Share Settlement”, annexed herein as Exhibit A) which sets 
forth the manner in which the Borough will ensure the opportunity for housing for 
low and moderate income families; and 

 
WHEREAS, in accordance with the Fair Share Settlement, the Borough has 

determined to provide for the construction of affordable housing on certain 
Borough-owned properties, and to acquire other properties as it deems necessary 
in order to provide for the construction of affordable housing; and 

 
 WHEREAS, in the Fair Share Settlement, the Borough has identified the 
property located at 63 Bernards Avenue and shown on the tax maps of the 
Borough of Bernardsville as Block 102, Lot 12  as a site for the development of 



 

 

Affordable Rental housing; and 
 
  WHEREAS, in accordance with N.J.S.A. 40A:12-5(a)(1) “any municipality, 

by ordinance, may provide for the acquisition of any real property, capital 
improvement, or personal property: (1) by purchase, gift, devise, lease, exchange, 
or condemnation;” and  
    
 WHEREAS, an appraiser retained by the City, Integra Realty Resources,   
determined the value of the Property to be $ 1,020,000.00 as more fully set forth 
in the Appraisal entitled “Appraisal of Real Property- 63 Bernards Avenue, 
Bernardsville, Somerset County, New Jersey 07924” dated July 22, 2020, which is 
attached hereto as Exhibit B and made a part of this Ordinance; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Borough Council wishes to authorize the Mayor and/or her 
designee to negotiate for the acquisition of the Property in an amount not to exceed 
the appraised value for the Property, and if negotiated purchase cannot be 
effectuated, to initiate eminent domain actions to acquire title to the Property under 
the Eminent Domain Act of 1971, N.J.S.A. 20:3-1 et seq. so long as all legal 
prerequisites for eminent domain are satisfied and to thereafter prosecute such 
eminent domain actions to completion and to arrange for the Borough to satisfy 
any judgments entered in such eminent domain proceedings.  
  
  
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MUNICIPAL COUNCIL 

OF THE BOROUGH OF NEWARK, NEW JERSEY THAT: 
 

Section 1. The appraisal of the Property prepared by the firm of Integra 
Realty Resources, LLC on behalf of the Borough is hereby accepted and 
approved in its entirety, including but not limited to the appraised value of $ 
1,020,000.00. 

Section 2.  After the effective date of this Ordinance, the Borough shall 
reserve the sum of $1,020,000.00 from the Bernardsville Affordable 
Housing Trust Fund and the Chief Financial Officer has certified the 
availability of funds for the purposes set forth herein. 

Section 3. The Mayor and/or her designee are hereby authorized to 
negotiate for the acquisition by voluntary purchase and, if voluntary 
purchase cannot be effectuated, to carry out the condemnation of 63 
Bernards Avenue and shown on the tax maps of the Borough of 
Bernardsville as Block 102, Lot 12 (the “Property”) in the amount not to 
exceed the appraised value of the Property for the purpose of  providing an 
opportunity for opportunity for housing for low and moderate income 
individuals and families.  

Section 4. The Mayor and/or her designee are hereby authorized  to 
execute any and all agreements and other legal documents necessary to 



 

 

accomplish the acquisition of the Property, including but not limited to a 
written offer for the purchase of the aforementioned property, land sale 
contracts and deeds for the sale of the Property and Verified Complaints, 
Declarations of Taking, and any other necessary documents for eminent 
domain proceedings for the Property in accordance with the Eminent 
Domain Act of 1971, N.J.S.A. 20:3-1 et seq.   

Section 5. In conjunction with said acquisition, the Borough hereby 
reserves and shall reserve any and all rights it had or may have to recover 
in any subsequent or pending action or by any administrative means, all 
costs of remediation and/or clean-up of contamination and/or removal of 
solid waste that have been incurred or may be incurred in the future by 
reason of conditions which were in existence as of or prior to the date of 
vesting of title and possession of the Property in the name of the City. 

Section 6. In conjunction with said acquisition, the Borough hereby 
reserves and shall reserve the right to seek in its sole discretion, any and 
all available legal, administrative and equitable remedies to compel the 
record owners and/or responsible parties to remediate and/or clean up the 
Property in accordance with applicable state and federal statutory and 
regulatory provisions or to remove solid waste. The Borough is not and shall 
not be liable for the clean-up and removal costs of any discharge which 
occurred or began prior to the City’s ownership. 

Section 7. The Mayor, Borough Council, and such other officials, 
consultants, agents, employees and professionals of the Borough as may 
be necessary and appropriate are hereby authorized and directed to take 
any and all actions necessary to effectuate the purposes of this Ordinance. 

Section 8. A copy of the Ordinance and any agreements authorized 
herein shall be placed on file with the Borough Clerk’s Office.  

Section 9. If any section, paragraph, subsection, clause or provision of 
this Ordinance shall be adjudged by the courts to be invalid, such 
adjudication shall apply only to the section, paragraph, subsection, clause 
or provisions so adjudicated, and the remainder of the Ordinance shall be 
deemed valid and effective. 

Section 10. This Ordinance shall take effect in accordance with the laws 
of the State of New Jersey after final passage and publication. 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

COUNCIL OF THE BOROUGH OF 
BERNARDSVILLE IN THE COUNTY 

ATTEST:      OF SOMERSET 
 
 
__________________________   _____________________________ 
Anthony Suriano, Borough Clerk   Mary Jane Canose, Mayor 
 
 
Introduction: 
1st Publication: 
Public Hearing and Adoption: 
2nd Publication: 
 
     STATEMENT 

 
This Ordinance authorizes the acquisition by purchase or condemnation of the 
property located at 63 Bernards Avenue and shown on the tax maps of the 
Borough of Bernardsville as Block 102, Lot 12 in the amount not to exceed the 
appraised value of $ 1,020,000.00 as of July 22, 2020. 



BERNARDSVILLE BOROUGH
ORDINANCE #2020-1851    

AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING AN EXPIRATION DATE FOR CONSTRUCTION
RECORDS CLEARANCE CERTIFICATES AND SUPPLEMENTING AND AMENDING
CHAPTER XII OF THE BOROUGH CODE ENTITLED "BUILDING AND HOUSING"

WHEREAS, Zoning Officer Geoff Price has recommended that Section 12-4 of the

Borough Code be amended to provide that construction records clearance certificates only be

valid for 90 days from the issue date;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the Borough of

Bernardsville, in the County of Somerset, State of New Jersey that Chapter XII of the Borough

Code entitled "Building and Housing" is hereby supplemented and amended as follows:

Section 1. Paragraph “a” of subsection 12-4.1 of Section 12-4 entitled "Construction

Records Clearance Certificate" is amended to read as follows:

12-4 CONSTRUCTION RECORDS CLEARANCE CERTIFICATE

12-4.1 When Required. 

a. No building or structure shall be occupied in whole or in part prior to the

issuance of a certificate of construction records clearance (CRC).  A current CRC shall

be required prior to the sale of any residential or commercial structure and prior to the

rental of any tenant space in a commercial structure within the Borough.  All CRC’s shall

expire ninety (90) days from the date of their issuance.

.****

Section 2. In all other respects, section 12-4 shall remain unchanged.

Section 3. Any or all other ordinances or parts thereof in conflict or inconsistent with

any of the terms hereof are hereby repealed to such extent as they are so in conflict or

inconsistent.

Section 4. In case any article, section or provision of this ordinance shall be held



2

invalid in any court of competent jurisdiction, the same shall not affect any other article, section

or provision of this ordinance except insofar as the article, section or provision so declared

invalid shall be inseparable from the remainder or any portion thereof.

Section 5. This ordinance shall become effective immediately upon final passage and

publication as required by law.

COUNCIL OF THE BOROUGH OF
BERNARDSVILLE IN THE COUNTY

ATTEST: OF SOMERSET

                                                     By:                                                       

Anthony Suriano, Clerk                Mayor Jane Canose, Mayor

Introduction:                                               

1st Publication:                                            

Public Hearing and Adoption:                                

2nd Publication:                                            

C:\Users\asuriano\Downloads\2020-08-06 Constr records clearance ORD amendment-.wpd



BERNARDSVILLE BOROUGH
ORDINANCE #2020-1853

APPROPRIATING AN ADDITIONAL $60,000 FROM THE BOROUGH OPEN SPACE
TRUST FUND FOR CONSTRUCTION OF THE POLO GROUNDS WALKING PATH

STATEMENT OF PURPOSE: To appropriate an additional $60,000 from the Borough Open

Space Trust Fund to supplement the $50,000 previously appropriated by Ordinance #2019-1812

for the construction of the Polo Grounds Walking Path

WHEREAS, up to 20% of the Borough’s Open Space Trust Fund monies may be used

for the development of lands acquired for recreation and conservation purposes; and

WHEREAS, “development” was defined in the 2008 public question to mean:

“[A]ny improvement to a land . . . area of eligible Borough property that is

designed to expand or enhance its utilization for outdoor recreation . . . purposes

and shall include the construction, renovation, or repair of any such improvement. 

This term may include any of the following types of ancillary improvements to

eligible Borough properties: roadways, parking, landscaping, fencing, lighting,

utilities, structures, and any other improvement that expands or enhances the use

of property for outdoor recreation . . . purposes.”; and

WHEREAS, the governing body wishes to construct a walking path at the Polo Grounds; 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and Council of the Borough of

Bernardsville in the County of Somerset, State of New Jersey as follows:

Section 1.   An additional $60,000 is hereby appropriated from the Borough Open Space

Trust Fund (development) to be used for the construction of a walking path at the Polo Grounds.

Section 2.  This $60,000 supplements the $50,000 previously appropriated for this

purpose by Ordinance #2019-1812 (for a total of $110,000).

Section 3. Any or all other ordinances or parts thereof in conflict or inconsistent with

any of the terms hereof are hereby repealed to such extent as they are so in conflict or

inconsistent.



Section 4. In case any article, section or provision of this ordinance shall be held

invalid in any court of competent jurisdiction, the same shall not affect any other article, section

or provision of this ordinance except insofar as the article, section or provision so declared

invalid shall be inseparable from the remainder or any portion thereof.

Section 5. This ordinance shall become effective immediately upon final passage and

publication as required by law.

COUNCIL OF THE BOROUGH OF

BERNARDSVILLE IN THE COUNTY

ATTEST: OF SOMERSET

                                                     By:                                                       

Anthony Suriano, Borough Clerk          Mary Jane Canose, Mayor

Introduction:                                               

1st Publication:                                            

Public Hearing and Adoption:                                

2nd Publication:                                            
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Base Bid Option #1            

(New Path Tennis Courts 

to Wetlands)

Alt. Bid # 1A                

(New Path - Porous 

Asphalt) 

Option 1 &1A

Alt. Bid 2A 

(Exisiting Path 

Porous Asphalt) 

Available Funding Funding Ordinance 

$76,950.00 $16,700.00 $93,650.00 $0.00 $50,000.00 $43,650.00

$76,950.00 $16,700.00 $93,650.00 $85,000.00 $50,000.00 $128,650.00

Base Bid Option #2         

(New Path Tennis Courts 

to Wetlands + New Path 

Backstop to Existing Path)

Alt. Bid # 1A                

(New Paths - Porous 

Asphalt) 

Option 1 &1A

Alt. Bid 2A 

(Exisiting Path 

Porous Asphalt) 

Available Funding Funding Ordinance 

$84,620.00 $25,200.00 $109,820.00 $0.00 $50,000.00 $59,820.00

$84,620.00 $25,200.00 $109,820.00 $85,000.00 $50,000.00 $144,820.00

U- Shape Path

Loop Path 



Polo Grounds Walking Path

Contractor

Base Bid Option #1     

(New Path Tennis Courts 

to Wetlands)

Alt. Bid # 1A                

(New Path - Porous 

Asphalt) 

Option 1 &1A
Alt. Bid # 1B                   

(New Path -  Stone Dust)
Option 1 & 1B

Alt. Bid # 1C                     

(New Path- Paver Grit)
Option 1 & 1C

TC Landscaping $71,248.45 $105,530.00 $176,778.45 $63,780.00 $135,028.45 $106,080.00 $177,328.45

Thor Construction $76,190.00 $36,240.00 $112,430.00 $36,150.00 $112,340.00 $66,700.00 $142,890.00

Halecon $76,950.00 $16,700.00 $93,650.00 $22,860.00 $99,810.00 $52,470.00 $129,420.00

JAG Paving $109,975.00 $41,150.00 $151,125.00 $37,300.00 $147,275.00 $46,700.00 $156,675.00

Sunset Creations Inc. $151,640.00 $31,760.00 $183,400.00 $39,385.00 $191,025.00 $63,825.00 $215,465.00

AA Berms LLC $215,625.00 $32,740.00 $248,365.00 $28,700.00 $244,325.00 $24,000.00 $239,625.00

Alpine Construction $225,186.00 $51,900.00 $277,086.00 $78,950.00 $304,136.00 $122,660.00 $347,846.00

Research & Design Landscape LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Salmon Bros. Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Kalogridis Contracting LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Balitano Contracting Co. Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Your Way Construction, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Diamond Construction NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Contractor

Base Bid Option #2         

(New Path Tennis Courts 

to Wetlands + New Path 

Backstop to Existing Path)

Alt. Bid # 1A                

(New Paths - Porous 

Asphalt) 

Option 2 & 1A
Alt. Bid # 1B                    

(New Paths -  Stone Dust)
Option 2 & 1B

Alt. Bid # 1C                     

(New Paths- Paver Grit)
Option 2 & 1C

Halecon $84,620.00 $25,200.00 $109,820.00 $35,460.00 $120,080.00 $80,820.00 $165,440.00

TC Landscaping $87,752.92 $180,000.00 $267,752.92 $107,080.00 $194,832.92 $176,900.00 $264,652.92

Thor Construction $89,090.00 $54,240.00 $143,330.00 $55,200.00 $144,290.00 $102,000.00 $191,090.00

JAG Paving $125,050.00 $58,800.00 $183,850.00 $54,000.00 $179,050.00 $68,400.00 $193,450.00

Sunset Creations Inc. $172,390.00 $46,260.00 $218,650.00 $58,810.00 $231,200.00 $96,250.00 $268,640.00

AA Berms LLC $220,700.00 $48,240.00 $268,940.00 $42,600.00 $263,300.00 $35,400.00 $256,100.00

Alpine Construction $344,082.00 $76,680.00 $420,762.00 $120,680.00 $464,762.00 $188,360.00 $532,442.00

Research & Design Landscape LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Salmon Bros. Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Kalogridis Contracting LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Balitano Contracting Co. Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Your Way Construction, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Diamond Construction NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 



Polo Grounds Walking Path

Contractor

Alt. Bid # 2A           

(Existing Path-                    

Porous Asphalt)

Option 1 &2A

Alt. Bid # 2B           

(Existing Path-                           

Stone Dust)

Option 1 &2B
Alt. Bid # 2C           

(Existing Path- Paver Grit)
Option 1 &2C

TC Landscaping $330,250.00 $401,498.45 $122,550.00 $193,798.45 $291,000.00 $362,248.45

Thor Construction $106,650.00 $182,840.00 $98,850.00 $175,040.00 $176,850.00 $253,040.00

Halecon $85,000.00 $161,950.00 $95,050.00 $172,000.00 $170,650.00 $247,600.00

JAG Paving $94,200.00 $204,175.00 $80,600.00 $190,575.00 $98,600.00 $208,575.00

Sunset Creations Inc. $111,800.00 $263,440.00 $125,275.00 $276,915.00 $187,675.00 $339,315.00

AA Berms LLC $128,275.00 $343,900.00 $114,175.00 $329,800.00 $102,175.00 $317,800.00

Alpine Construction $222,300.00 $447,486.00 $273,700.00 $498,886.00 $385,300.00 $610,486.00

Research & Design Landscape LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Salmon Bros. Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Kalogridis Contracting LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Balitano Contracting Co. Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Your Way Construction, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Diamond Construction NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Contractor

Alt. Bid # 2A           

(Existing Path-                    

Porous Asphalt)

Option 2 &2A

Alt. Bid # 2B           

(Existing Path-                           

Stone Dust)

Option 2 &2B
Alt. Bid # 2C           

(Existing Path- Paver Grit)
Option 2 &2C

Halecon $85,000.00 $169,620.00 $95,050.00 $204,870.00 $170,650.00 $280,470.00

TC Landscaping $255,150.00 $342,902.92 $165,250.00 $433,002.92 $251,300.00 $519,052.92

Thor Construction $106,650.00 $195,740.00 $98,850.00 $242,180.00 $176,850.00 $320,180.00

JAG Paving $94,200.00 $219,250.00 $80,600.00 $264,450.00 $98,600.00 $282,450.00

Sunset Creations Inc. $111,800.00 $284,190.00 $101,275.00 $319,925.00 $187,675.00 $406,325.00

AA Berms LLC $128,275.00 $348,975.00 $114,175.00 $383,115.00 $102,175.00 $371,115.00

Alpine Construction $222,300.00 $566,382.00 $273,700.00 $694,462.00 $385,300.00 $806,062.00

Research & Design Landscape LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Salmon Bros. Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Kalogridis Contracting LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Balitano Contracting Co. Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Your Way Construction, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Diamond Construction NO BID NO BID NO BID 



ORDINANCE #2020-1854 
ORDINANCE OF THE BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE, COUNTY OF 
SOMERSET, NEW JERSEY ADOPTING THE REDEVELOPMENT PLAN 
FOR BLOCK 70, LOTS 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 6.01, 6.02, 6.03, 6.04, 6.05, 6.06, 6.07 
AND  6.08; BLOCK 71, LOTS 4, 5, 5.01, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12 AND 13 AND THE 
QUIMBY LANE RIGHT OF WAY AS SHOWN ON THE OFFICIAL TAX 
MAP OF THE BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE PURSUANT TO THE 
LOCAL REDEVELOPMENT AND HOUSING LAW, N.J.S.A. 40A:12A-1 
ET SEQ. (Quimby Lane) 

 

WHEREAS, the Borough of Bernardsville, in the County of Somerset, New Jersey (the 

“Borough”), a public body corporate and politic of the State of New Jersey (the “State”), is 

authorized pursuant to the Local Redevelopment and Housing Law, N.J.S.A. 40A:12A-1 et seq. 

(the “Redevelopment Law”), to determine whether certain parcels of land within the Borough 

constitute an area in need of rehabilitation and/or an area in need of redevelopment; and  

 
WHEREAS, the Mayor and Borough Council adopted a Resolution on October 15, 2019 

(Resolution #19-203) authorizing the Planning Board of the Borough of Bernardsville (the 

“Planning Board”) to conduct an investigation to determine if certain property identified as Block 

70, Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 6.01, 6.02, 6.03, 6.04, 6.05, 6.06, 6.07, and 6.08; Block 71, Lots 4, 5, 5.01, 

6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12 and 13; Block 98, Lot 1; Block 124, Lot 1; and Block 144, Lot 1, as shown on 

the official Tax Map of the Borough (the “Study Area”), constitutes a non-condemnation “area in 

need of redevelopment,” in accordance with the Redevelopment Law; and 

 

WHEREAS, on December 12, 2019 the Planning Board held a public hearing, duly noticed 

under the Redevelopment Law, and reviewed an investigation/report titled “Preliminary 

Investigation – Quimby Lane, Bernardsville, NJ” and dated November 25, 2019 prepared by 

Topology LLC, (the “Study”); and 

WHEREAS, the Borough Planning Board, after conducting the required investigation and 

holding a public hearing on December 12, 2019 recommended that the Study Area met the statutory 

criteria; and 

 WHEREAS, the Borough Council on January 13, 2020 adopted a Resolution accepting 

the Planning Board’s recommendation that the area was found to meet the necessary statutory 

criteria, and designated the entire Study Area as a Non-Condemnation Area in Need of 

Redevelopment; and  

WHEREAS, pursuant to the provisions of N.J.S.A. 40A:12A-7(e and f) and N.J.S.A. 

40A:12A-15 of the Redevelopment Law, the Borough’s staff and/or Planning Board professionals, 

is permitted to prepare a redevelopment plan; and 

WHEREAS, a redevelopment plan for the Study Area titled “Quimby Lane 

Redevelopment Plan” dated September 14, 2020, has been prepared by Topology and submitted 

to the Borough Council for review (the “Redevelopment Plan”); and 

WHEREAS, the Borough Council directs the Planning Board to conduct a hearing to 

review the Redevelopment Plan to determine if it is consistent with the Borough’s Masterplan; and 



 WHEREAS, upon receipt and review of the Planning Board’s recommendations relating 

to the Redevelopment Plan, the Borough Council desires to adopt the Redevelopment Plan in order 

to effectuate a plan that is consistent with the goals and objectives of the Borough for the 

redevelopment of the Property; and 

WHEREAS, the Borough Council believes that the adoption of the Redevelopment Plan 

is in the best interest of the Borough for the redevelopment of the Property. 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOROUGH COUNCIL OF THE 
BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE, NEW JERSEY AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1. The aforementioned recitals are incorporated herein as though fully set forth 

at length. 

Section 2. Upon introduction of the Ordinance the Borough Clerk is hereby directed to 

forward a copy of this Ordinance and the Redevelopment Plan to the Borough Planning Bord for a 

consistency review and comment pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:12A-7(f). 

Section 3.  The Redevelopment Plan titled “Quimby Lane Redevelopment Plan” dated 

September 9, 2020 is hereby adopted pursuant to the terms of N.J.S.A. 40A:12A-7 of the 

Redevelopment Law. 

Section 4. The zoning district map in the zoning ordinance of the Borough is hereby 

amended to include the Property per the boundaries described in the Redevelopment Plan and the 

provisions thereon. 

Section 5. If any part of this Ordinance shall be deemed invalid, such parts shall be 

severed and the invalidity thereby shall not affect the remaining parts of this Ordinance. 

Section 6. A copy of this Ordinance and the Redevelopment Plan shall be available for 

public inspection at the office of the City Clerk during regular business hours. 

Section 7. This Ordinance shall take effect in accordance with all applicable laws. 
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RESOLUTION #20-209

CHANGING THE CUSTODIAN OF THE RECREATION OFFICE PETTY CASH FUND

WHEREAS, Cheryl Ferrante, Recreation Director, was the custodian of the Recreation Office

Petty Cash Fund; and

WHEREAS, in accordance with NJSA 40:5-21, the Borough of Bernardsville is changing

custodians to Robert Markowick, Recreation Director.

WHEREAS, Robert Markowick is covered by the Borough Blanket Bond provided (pursuant to

statute) by the Suburban Municipal Joint Insurance Fund.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Borough Council of the Borough of

Bernardsville, County of Somerset, hereby authorizes such action and two copies of this

resolution be filed with the Division of Local Government Services, New Jersey Department of

Community Affairs for approval.

I, Anthony Suriano, Clerk of the Borough of Bernardsville, hereby certify the foregoing to be a

true and exact copy of a resolution adopted by the Borough Council at a duly convened meeting

held on September 14, 2020.

____________________________

petty cash.wpd



BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE
RESOLUTION #20-210

AUTHORIZING DEER MANAGEMENT HUNT ON BOROUGH-OWNED
PROPERTIES FOR THE 2020-2021 BOW HUNTING SEASON

WHEREAS, The Green Team has presented evidence to the Borough of the negative

impact of the deer population on the environment, health and quality of life; and 

WHEREAS, the governing body created a subcommittee to develop options regarding

deer management; and 

WHEREAS, this subcommittee, the Green Team, the Environmental Commission, and

the Shade Tree Commission have recommended that hunting be permitted on certain Borough-

owned properties, including Borough Springs/Laurelwood, Whitenack, Charlotte Hill, Little

Brook Sanctuary, 251 Claremont Road, and Peter’s Tract; and

WHEREAS, the Council has decided to authorize a deer management hunt, subject to

satisfying all requirements of the Police Department, adhering to all safety regulations,  posting

of properties, and conducting a public outreach program to the satisfaction of the Borough; and

WHEREAS, the subcommittee has recommended that Warren Blue Ridge Sportsman’s

Club, 1383 Schindler Drive, South Plainfield, NJ, a nonprofit hunting club, be authorized to

conduct the initial deer management hunt; and 

WHEREAS, Green Acres advised the Borough Attorney in a November 24, 2015 email

that “the Borough’s authorization to allow Warren Blue Ridge Sportsman’s Club to carry out the

deer management program on five specific properties is consistent with Green Acres

regulations”; and

WHEREAS, the Mayor and Council may authorize future hunts at their discretion as they

see fit;



2

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED by the governing body of the

Borough of Bernardsville, in the County of Somerset, State of New Jersey, that the Warren Blue

Ridge Sportsman’s Club is hereby authorized to conduct a deer management hunt on those

Borough-owned properties described in the preamble, subject to the following terms and

conditions:

1. The authorization shall be for the 2020-2021 bow hunting season, to be conducted

according to ordinance and/or State Game laws

2. Members of the Warren Blue Ridge Sportsman’s Club may only hunt with a bow and

arrow during the appropriate hunting seasons and with the proper hunting licenses.

3. The Warren Blue Ridge Sportsman’s Club shall comply with all the terms and conditions

of the Bernardsville Deer Management Program 2020-2021 (as amended from time-to-

time by the Borough Council), which is incorporated herein by reference.

4. The governing body can revoke this authorization in its sole discretion at any time, with

or without cause.

5. The  Warren Blue Ridge Sportsman’s Club shall provide with certificates of insurance

with all coverages required by the Borough Risk Manager with minimum limits of

$2,000,000, and naming the Borough as an additional insured.  All such policies shall be

subject to the approval of the Borough’s Risk Manager.

6. Whenever requested by the Mayor and Council, the Warren Blue Ridge Sportsman’s

Club will provide the Mayor and Council with reports on the program, specifying the

harvest of the deer to the Borough and to the State, their subsequent use in regard to

butchering and an evaluation of the hunt and any recommendations for the future.
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I, Anthony Suriano, Clerk of the Borough of Bernardsville, hereby certify the foregoing

to be a true and exact copy of a motion adopted by the Borough Council at a duly convened

meeting held Monday, September 14, 2020.

                                                        

Anthony Suriano, Borough Clerk

H:\MyDocs\DOCS\Resolutions\deer management2020-21.wpd
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BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE
RESOLUTION #20-212

AUTHORIZING RENEWAL OF A.B.C. LICENSES

WHEREAS, applications for October 1, 2020 to June 30, 2021 were filed with the A.B.C.: 

NAME          ADDRESS              TYPE NUMBER  

Due Terre LLC   107 Morristown Rd. C 1803-33-004-010

T/A Osteria Morini

Bernardsville Wine Co. LLC  100 Morristown Rd. D     1803-44-007-007

T/A Gary’s Wine & Marketplace

Claremont Restaurant Group LLC 121 Claremont Rd. C 1803-33-002-006

T/A Claremont Tavern

Berkeley Wine Co., LLC 79 Morristown Rd. D 1803-44-010-005

T/A Adelphia Wine Co. 

WHEREAS, inspection reports have been received from the Health Officer, Building, Zoning, Fire

Officials and the Bernardsville Police Department, and no conditions were found which would preclude

renewal; and

WHEREAS, each licensee has paid the appropriate fee to the Borough of $2500; and

WHEREAS, Clearance Certificates for renewal have been received from the State of New Jersey

Division of Taxation for each licensee and a Special Ruling to permit renewal has been received from

the Division of A.B.C for inactive licenses.  

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Borough Council of the Borough of Bernardsville,

that the aforementioned licenses be renewed for the current licensing year, and that the Borough Clerk

is hereby directed to issue and deliver said licenses, which shall be effective October 1, 2020.      

I, Anthony Suriano, Clerk of the Borough of Bernardsville, hereby certify the foregoing to be a true and

exact copy of a resolution adopted by the Borough Council at a duly convened meeting held September

14, 2020.                                                                                                                               

__________________________

abc renewal 20-21          



 
 
 
 
 
 

BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE, NJ 
 

RESOLUTION #20-213 
AUTHORIZATION TO REFUND 

OVERPAYMENT OF MUNICIPAL MATCH 
2020/2021 MUNICIPAL ALLIANCE GRANT 

 
 

WHEREAS, the Borough of Bernardsville received an estimated municipal match for the 2020/2021 Municipal 
Alliance Grant from the Township of Bedminster in the amount of $1,227.34; and, 
 
WHEREAS, due to COVID-19, the amount of the 2020/2021 Municipal Alliance grant has been reduced, 
therefore reducing the required match from the participating municipalities; and, 
 
WHEREAS, the actual amount due for the Township of Bedminster is $640.02, 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Borough Council of the Borough of Bernardsville, NJ that the 
Treasurer is hereby authorized to refund the Township of Bedminster in the amount of $587.32. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
I, Anthony Suriano, Clerk of the Borough of Bernardsville, hereby certify the foregoing to be a true and exact 
copy of a resolution adopted by the Borough Council at a duly convened meeting held on September 14, 2020. 
 
 
          ____________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Name and Address  Amount 

 
Township of Bedminster 
One Miller Lane 
Bedminster, NJ  07921 
 

 
$ 587.32 



RESOLUTION #20-214

MEMORIALIZING THE APPOINTMENT OF 
TOM ANDERSON AS TEMPORARY PART TIME FIRE INSPECTOR

BE IT RESOLVED by the Borough Council of the Borough of Bernardsville to memorialize the

appointment of Tom Anderson as a Temporary Part Time Fire Inspector at a salary of $25.00/hr., up

to 14 hours per week, effective August 19, 2020.

FURTHER RESOLVED the appointment is subject to provisions of the Employee Handbook of

the Borough of Bernardsville.

FURTHER RESOLVED the temporary period of employment is not to exceed December 31, 2020.

I, Anthony Suriano, Borough Clerk of the Borough of Bernardsville, hereby certify the foregoing to

be a true and exact copy of a resolution adopted by the Governing Body at a duly convened meeting

held September 14, 2020.

________________________



BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE
RESOLUTION #20-215       

EXTENDING TIME TO AWARD WALKING PATH CONTRACT

WHEREAS, bids for the construction of a walking path at the Polo Grounds were received

on July 23, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, the apparent low bid in the amount of $109,820 was received from Halecon

Inc. of Bridgewater, New Jersey; and 

WHEREAS, the Local Public Contracts Law provides in N.J.S.A. 40A:11-24 that, “The

contracting unit shall award the contract or reject all bids within . . .  60 days, except that the bids

of any bidders who consent thereto may, at the request of the contracting unit, be held for

consideration for such longer period as may be agreed . . . ”; and

WHEREAS, the Borough cannot award this contract until additional monies are

appropriated from the Open Space Trust Fund (development); and

WHEREAS, an ordinance is being introduced simultaneously herewith appropriating the

additional funds; and

WHEREAS, it is anticipated that ordinance will be adopted at the October 13 Council

meeting; and

WHEREAS, Halecon has agreed to extend the time in which the Borough has to award this

bid for an additional 30 days; 



NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the Borough of

Bernardsville, in the County of Somerset, State of New Jersey, that the time in which the Borough

has to award a contract for the construction of the Polo Grounds walking path is hereby extended to

October 21, 2020. 

I, Anthony Suriano, Clerk of the Borough of Bernardsville, hereby certify the foregoing to

be a true and exact copy of a resolution adopted by the Governing Body at a duly convened meeting

held Monday, September 14, 2020.

                                                           

Anthony Suriano, Clerk

C:\Users\asuriano\Downloads\2020-09-09 BV Res Extending Time - Awarding Walking Path Bid.wpd



 
 
 
 
 
 
BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE, NJ 

 
RESOLUTION #20-216 

AUTHORIZATION OF TAX REFUND 
 

 

WHEREAS, the following tax overpayment exists due to a billing adjustment, duplicate payment and/or an 
incorrect figure paid for the following parcel(s); and 
 

 
 
WHEREAS, the tax collector is recommending a refund be issued. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Borough Council of the Borough of Bernardsville, NJ that the 
Tax Collector is hereby authorized to refund the aforementioned tax overpayment(s) 
 
 
I, Anthony Suriano, Clerk of the Borough of Bernardsville, hereby certify the foregoing to be a true and exact 
copy of a resolution adopted by the Borough Council at a duly convened meeting held on September 14, 2020. 
 
          ____________________________________ 
redemption.res 
 

Block & Lot Quarter & Year Amount Reason for Refund Issue Refund To 
44/8 2020/3 $3241.62 Duplicate Payment  Brad & Donna Fox 

70 Old Fort Road 
Bernardsville, NJ  07924 



RESOLUTION #20-217 
 

CORRECTIVE ACTION PLAN FOR 2019 AUDIT REPORT OF THE 
BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE, SOMERSET COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 

 
WHEREAS, Local Finance Notice #92-15 issued July 8, 1992, requires that all municipalities 

prepare and submit a Corrective Action Plan as part of their annual audit process and in 

accordance with OMB Circulars and #92-15; and 

 

WHEREAS, the resolution is submitted to the Division of Local Government Services, 

Department of Community Affairs and placed on file with the clerk sixty (60) days from the date 

the audit is received by the governing body; and 

 

WHEREAS, the audit report was distributed to the governing body on July 22, 2020; and 

 

WHEREAS, the corrective action plan responding to comments in the 2019 Audit Report has 

been prepared by Ralph A. Maresca, Jr., Chief Financial Officer and submitted to the governing 

body of the Borough of Bernardsville for their consideration. 

 

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Mayor and Council of the Borough of 

Bernardsville, Somerset County, New Jersey, approves the corrective action plan discussed 

herein and directs the Chief Financial Officer of the Borough to carry out the Corrective Action 

Plan for the 2019 Audit Report and to forward a copy of this resolution to the Department of 

Community Affairs. 

 

I, Anthony Suriano, Clerk of the Borough of Bernardsville, do hereby certify the foregoing to be 

a true and exact copy of a resolution adopted by the Borough Council at a duly convened 

meeting held September 14, 2020, adopted by not less than the legal vote needed of the members 

of the Borough Council. 

        _____________________________ 

        Borough Clerk 
 



RESOLUTION #20-218

AMENDING THE PROFESSIONAL SERVICES CONTRACT WITH 
BEVAN, MOSCA, & GIUDITTA AND EXETER ASSOCIATES, INC.

WHEREAS, the Borough of Bernardsville adopted Resolution #20-156 on May 26, 2020 and

entered into a Professional Services Contract with Bevan, Mosca, & Giuditta and Exeter

Associates, Inc. for legal services in connection with opposing the proposed rate increase of NJ

American Water Company; and

WHEREAS, the contract, which included participation from other municipalities, stated that the

total compensation was not to exceed $4,200 unless authorized by the governing body.  

WHEREAS, one town dropped out of said contract and the cost for Bernardsville is $5,388.57 

BE IT RESOLVED by the Borough Council of the Borough of Bernardsville, to amend said

contract to increase the total amount not to exceed by an additional $1,800 for a total of $6,000

for 2020.

I, Anthony Suriano, Clerk of the Borough of Bernardsville, hereby certify the foregoing to be a

true and exact copy of a resolution adopted by the Borough Council at a duly convened meeting

held on September 14, 2020.

____________________________

amend contract amount6



RESOLUTION #20-219

AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR AND CLERK TO SIGN A 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES CONTRACT WITH BURGIS ASSOCIATES 

WHEREAS, there exists a need for services for review and preparation of ordinances for

downtown zoning and signage and a certification of funds has been approved by the C.M.F.O. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Borough Council of the Borough of

Bernardsville as follows:

(1) The Mayor and Clerk are hereby authorized to sign a Professional Services

Agreement with Burgis Associates.

(2) This contract is awarded without competitive bidding as a “Professional Service”

in accordance with 40A:11-5(1)(a) of the Local Public Contracts Law.

(3) The amount of this contract shall be for an amount not to exceed $6,000.

I, Ralph A. Maresca, Jr., C.M.F.O., hereby certify, in accordance with requirements of N.J.A.C.

5:30-14.5, that funds for the project discussed herein are available in 10-C00-155-0200.

_____________________________

         

I, Anthony Suriano, Clerk of the Borough of Bernardsville, hereby certify the foregoing to be a

true and exact copy of a resolution adopted by the Borough Council at a duly convened meeting

held on September 14, 2020.

                                                                

Resolutions\prof-service



 
 
 
 
 
 

BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE, NJ 
 

RESOLUTION #20-220 
AUTHORIZATION TO REFUND 

OVERPAYMENT OF MUNICIPAL MATCH 
2020/2021 MUNICIPAL ALLIANCE GRANT 

 
 

WHEREAS, the Borough of Bernardsville received an estimated municipal match for the 2020/2021 Municipal 
Alliance Grant from the Borough of Far Hills in the amount of $118.68; and, 
 
WHEREAS, due to COVID-19, the amount of the 2020/2021 Municipal Alliance grant has been reduced, 
therefore reducing the required match from the participating municipalities; and, 
 
WHEREAS, the actual amount due for the Borough of Far Hills is $61.89, 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Borough Council of the Borough of Bernardsville, NJ that the 
Treasurer is hereby authorized to refund the Borough of Far Hills in the amount of $56.76. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
I, Anthony Suriano, Clerk of the Borough of Bernardsville, hereby certify the foregoing to be a true and exact 
copy of a resolution adopted by the Borough Council at a duly convened meeting held on September 14, 2020. 
 
 
          ____________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Name and Address  Amount 

 
Borough of Far Hills 
6 Prospect Street 
Far Hills, NJ  07931 
 

 
$ 56.76 



 
 
 
 
 
 

BOROUGH OF BERNARDSVILLE, NJ 
 

RESOLUTION #20-221 
AUTHORIZATION OF SEWER REFUND 

 
 

WHEREAS, the following sewer overpayment exists due to an overpayment and/or an incorrect figure paid for 
the following parcel(s); and 
 

 
WHEREAS, the tax collector is recommending a refund be issued. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Borough Council of the Borough of Bernardsville, NJ that the 
Tax Collector is hereby authorized to refund the aforementioned tax overpayment(s) 
 
 
I, Anthony Suriano, Clerk of the Borough of Bernardsville, hereby certify the foregoing to be a true and exact 
copy of a resolution adopted by the Borough Council at a duly convened meeting held on September 14, 2020. 
 
          ____________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
redemption.res 
 

Block & Lot & 
Account Number 

Installment Amount Reason for Refund Issue Refund To 

 
61/5 –  
465-0 
 

 
2020-2 

 
$587.72 

 
Duplicate Payment 

 
Eileen F. Cosgrove 
912 Cane Ash Ct 
Lexington, SC  29073 
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